
 

XTouch PF10sV2 10.1 inch Wifi Only (2681 R)

Location Gauteng, Centurion
https://www.freeadsz.co.za/x-147370-z

XT-PF10SV2-BLACK

  Please visit www.technowave.co.za to place orders and view our full range of products.

  XTouch PF10sV2 10.1 inch Wifi Only , Bluetooth 4.0 , MS Windows 10 Professional Tablet PC Series -
Intel BayTrail-T Z3735G Quad core 1.33 GHz 2MB L2 Cache , Max Turbo Frequency up to 1.83Ghz ,
1024 DDR3L-RS 1333 Memory , 16GB eMMC Internal storage , Support up to 64GB External Storage via
Micro SD Card Slot , 10.1 inch HD IPS Capacitive Multi-Touch Screen , 1280 x 800 Resolution ,
802.11b/g/n Wireless Lan, Bluetooth Ver 4.0 , 2.0 Mega Pixel Primary Back Camera , 0.3 Mega Pixel
Secondary Back Camera , 1x Micro HDMI Output , 1 x Micro USB Port , Full Size USB 2.0 Port , 3.5mm
Audio Jack , Built-in Microphone , Integrated Speaker , Gravity Sensor , 6600mAh Polymer Battery ,
Microsoft Windows 10 Professional 32 bit Edition Operating System -Black, Retail Box , 1 year warranty
  Product Overview
  The XTouch PF10sV2 10.1inch Windows 10 Professional Tablet PC Series is a sleek and powerful
device that offers you best of both worlds, ideal for everyday tablet computing for work and play. It's light,
thin and fast, designed to be your daily life companion for all your professional and play needs.

  The XTouch PF10sV2 with High Definition 10.1 inch, IPS Capacitive Display, supports Resolution of
1280 x 800 pixels with 16: 10 Aspect Ratio features Microsoft Windows 10 Professional as the operating
system coupled with the Intel BayTrail-T Z3735FG Quad Core processor with 1.3Ghz processing power
and Intel HD Graphics. It also features 1GB internal memory, 16GB eMMC Internal storage that runs the
operating system flawlessly, to punch through those day-to-day office activities and enjoy multimedia,
games, browsing and socialising anytime, anywhere.

  This highly portable Microsoft Windows 10 Professional based Tablet PC also support up to 64GB
External Storage via a Micro/SD Card Slot, it also comes standard with WiFi connectivity option that
enable you to browse the Internet at high speeds, to connect to a 3G Network an external USB Modem
Dongle is required to connect on the on-board USB 2.0 Port. Other input options like a Micro HDMI output
port makes it a breeze to watch your favourite series and online shows when connected to a big screen.

  The Bluetooth 4.0, the newest version of the technology can handle both the 4.0 technology, as well as
classic Bluetooth abilities, such as transferring files, or connecting to a hands-free devices. This Tablet
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PC is also equipped with a 2.0MP Mega Pixel Rear-Facing camera and a 0.3MP Mega Pixel camera on
the front for Video chat or to capture your favourite moments as well as a range of extras such as 3.5mm
audio jack, Microphone and Internal.
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